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Guilford County’s General Terms and Conditions 

1. This bid package serves as official notice that GUILFORD COUNTY is soliciting and
will receive bids for the item(s) and/or service(s) stated on the event cover page
and outlined in the Bid specifications. Bids shall be submitted electronically via
the Purchasing Department’s Strategic Sourcing website:
https://www.guilfordcountync.gov/our-county/purchasing
by the event close date and time specified.

2. All addenda to this bid package will be issued electronically. No oral changes by
anyone shall affect this bid package.

3. The official bid price, quote, response for RFP, RFQ, or otherwise instructed;
shall be signed by a duly authorized person acknowledging full understanding of the
bid information and all addenda. The signature shall be witnessed and the Corporate
Seal affixed if a corporation. The exact legal name of the corporation or other
entity shall be provided

4. Price quotes shall be net, to include all discounts and delivery charges to
GUILFORD COUNTY. In cases of difference between unit price and total price, unit
price shall prevail unless otherwise noted.

5. Bid event submittal schedules are fixed and will not be amended unless Guilford
County determines the County has given cause to extend the event.

6. Items and services bid are for delivery or completion as soon as possible unless
otherwise stated. Delivery or completion dates could therefore be important in
making the award.

7. With the exception of construction bids, state and local sales taxes are not to be
included in quotes, but they are to be added later to all invoices shown as a
separate line item for payment. Federal sales-excise) taxes, where applicable, are
to be included in quotes as they are a part of the purchase price. See the
construction bid specifications in the event for construction and repair sales
tax instructions.

8. All Formal Bids will be publicly opened and recorded at the date and time specified
by and in the Purchasing Department. It is GUILFORD COUNTY's policy to announce
the award electronically. All other information, except that specifically noted by
the Supplier as being of a Confidential nature, becomes public record in accordance
with GS 132 and other applicable North Carolina laws. All interested parties are
invited to attend any Formal Bid opening.

9. GUILFORD COUNTY will have a period of thirty (30) days, unless otherwise stated,
after opening to analyze and award to lowest responsive and responsible bidder
based on service, quality, delivery date, performance data and price. The
successful supplier shall promptly enter into a contract acceptable to Guilford
County.

10. All Events/Bids in the Formal Range require the final approval of the GUILFORD
COUNTY Board of Commissioners who normally meet in open session two times each
month, the first and third Thursday at 5:30 PM. Everyone is invited to attend
those meetings.

11. A Bid Deposit may be required. If this is the case, it will be clearly stated in
the Event specifications for each package. If a bid deposit is required, it should
be no less than 5% of the total bid in cash, cashier’s check, certified check, or a
Bid Bond. The checks shall be drawn on a bank or trust company insured by the
Federal Deposit Insurance Corporation; and, the bond shall be a corporate surety
licensed under the State of North Carolina.  The obligee in either check or bond
shall be Guilford County.
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12. If Bid Deposit Checks are received, they will be returned to all suppliers when the
successful supplier has been selected and the contract awarded by Guilford County.
The successful deposit check will be returned when the required contract has been
executed.

13. In addition to the bid deposit or bid bond, some supplier’s may require a separate
Performance Bond and/or laborers-materials men’s bond as provided by law in the
amount of the contract by the awarded supplier(s). If this is required, it will be
clearly stated in the bid specifications. In place of a bond; cash, cashiers check,
certified check or government securities shall be acceptable.

14. Guilford County reserves the right to reject any or all bids if in the best
interest of the County.

15. In case of default by the Supplier, Guilford County shall retain the Bid Deposit or
call upon the Bid Bond surety unless otherwise provided by Law.

16. Guilford County’s policy is normally Net 30 days upon completion and acceptance.
In the case of some longer term projects, Guilford County may choose to release
partial payments to the supplier each month based on 90% of the estimated value of
the work completed. The final payment will be released within thirty (30) days or
less after the satisfactory completion of all work, its acceptance by Guilford
County and the settlement of all other claims and accounts.

17. In the case of Continuing Service Type Contracts, payment will be made monthly or
as otherwise agreed upon.

18. It is Guilford County’s Purchasing Policy to conduct all purchasing within the
North Carolina Laws and Guilford County Purchasing Policy, to provide each
supplier/contractor an equal opportunity to participate, and to award on a best
value basis. In order to accomplish our policy, we intend to make every
supplier/contractor aware of each purchasing opportunity. Contracts shall be
awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder(s) based on quality,
performance and the time specified in the proposal for the performance of the
contract. Suppliers/contractors should register online at
www.co.guilford.nc.us/sourcing.

19. A Material Safety Data Sheet (MSDS) shall be furnished to Guilford County for all
products purchased that contain hazardous material and/or components.

20. Any supplier/contractor performing work on GUILFORD COUNTY property is required to
have adequate Liability and Workers Compensation Insurance that will fully protect
GUILFORD COUNTY from any damages to property and/or persons caused by the
supplier/contractor.

21. The Supplier shall take Affirmative Action in complying with all Federal and State
requirements concerning fair employment without regard to discrimination by reason
of race, color, religion, sex, national origin or physical handicap.

22. The successful Supplier is responsible for compliance with all applicable Local,
State and Federal Laws, including all state and local permits, licenses and fees.
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23. If the Supplier/Contractor should undergo merger, acquisition or any change in
their ownership or their name for any reason, the provider shall immediately notify
Guilford County in writing of these changes and provide Guilford County with legal
documentation supporting these changes, such as an Assumption Agreement, Bill of
Sale, Articles of Incorporation, Articles of Amendment, sales contract, merger
documents, etc. Further, the Supplier/Contractor shall submit the name and address
of their registered agent for Service of Process and/or all notices required under
the contract(s). This contract shall not be assumed or otherwise transferred to
another party by the Supplier/Contractor without the express written consent of
Guilford County, which said consent will be evidenced by acceptance memo, letter or
e-mail from the Guilford County Manager, or designee, to the original
Supplier/Contractor under the contract and the assuming Supplier/Contractor.

24. Provider shall operate as an independent contractor for all purposes. The Parties
agree to each be solely responsible for their own acts or omissions in the
performance of each of their individual duties hereunder, and shall be financially
and legally responsible for all liabilities, costs, damages, expenses and attorney
fees resulting from, or attributable to any and all of their individual acts or
omissions to the extent allowable by law.

25. Guilford County and the awarded Vendor shall comply with Equal Employment
Opportunities (EEO) requirements, and to take affirmative action to ensure that all
individuals have an equal opportunity for employment without regard to race, color,
religion, sex, sexual orientation, gender identity, national origin, age,
disability, genetic information, or veteran status under the Guilford County EEO
Plan, as amended, implemented pursuant to 41 CFR Part 60-2.10(a)(3), 41 CFR §60-
741.44(a) and 41 CFR §60-300.44(a), and in accordance with the following laws, as
amended: Title VII and Title IX of the Civil Rights Act of 1964; The Equal Pay Act
of 1963; Executive Order 11246; the Age Discrimination in Employment Act of 1967;
the Rehabilitation Act of 1973, as amended (Section 503); the Americans with
Disabilities Act of 1990; the Vietnam Era Veterans’ Readjustment Assistance Act of
1974 (VEVRAA); the Civil Rights Restoration Act of 1988; NC General Statutes
Chapters 116 and 126 and Title II of the Genetic Information Nondiscrimination Act
of 2008, the North Carolina Equal Employment Opportunity Policy effective June 1,
2015, along with all other applicable federal and state laws governing equal
employment opportunities.

26. This contract is governed by the Laws of the State of North Carolina.
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Request for Proposals for Professional Services 

Security Services for Guilford County  

Event # 646 AMENDED 3-20-19 

Commodity Code: 990

I. Introduction 

On behalf of the Guilford County Security Department, the Guilford County Purchasing 
Department is soliciting Proposals for contracted security services.   The services required 
include: 

1) Regular Security Services

Unarmed, Armed, Supervisors and Operations Manager 

2) Company Police Services

Two contracts will be awarded to one or two qualified service provider(s).   

The initial three-year contract term has two one -year renewal options at the original pricing.  
The effective date of the contract is July 1, 2019 through June 30, 2022.  Two renewal options 
for one-year each are additional for a total contract period of up to five years. 

II. Background, Objective and Goals

Location:  Services are performed in various Guilford County (County) facilities.  Attachment B 
provides information for current locations and estimated hours.   The schedule and locations 
are subject to change based on the needs of the County.  

Security Services to be provided:  Perform screening for weapons and contraband, conduct 
patrols of various facilities to detect and deter criminal activity, lawfully detain violators when 
appropriate, write concise reports, secure and document found property/contraband.  Review 
credentials and identification of visitors, provide assistance and customer service to the public 
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and government employees.  Monitor Closed Circuit TV camera systems and alarms and 
perform other duties as directed. 

Company Police services to be provided:  Perform screening for weapons and contraband, 
conduct patrols of various facilities to detect and deter criminal activity, lawfully cite, detain, or 
arrest violators when appropriate, write concise reports, secure and document found 
property/contraband.  Review credentials and identification of visitors, provide assistance and 
customer service to the public and government employees.  Access the NC Aware system.  
Services may include arranging or providing safe transport of people in custody.  Company 
Police may also be called upon to perform security duties as described herein. 

III. General Requirements

Contractors must meet the following general requirements to be considered: 

1) The County requires that Contractor’s personnel are paid minimum rates as follows:

Minimum Hourly Pay Rates  

POSITION RATE 
Manager $16.50 

Site Supervisor $12.50 

Company Police Officer $18.00 

Armed Security Officer $14.00 

Security Officer $10.90 

2) Contractor must be licensed by the NC Private Protective Services Board for security services
and the selected Company Police provider by the NC Attorney General’s office.   

3) Contractors must be practicing equal opportunity employers. Unlawful discrimination of any
kind will be grounds for cancellation of the contract.   

4) Contractors shall provide to Guilford County for informational purposes only, an attachment
describing their equal opportunity plan if any, and the current makeup of their local staff 
including managements by diversity categories of Minority, Ethnicity, and Gender. 

5) Selected contractor(s) shall have a minimum of three years of verifiable experience
performing work that is similar in scope and nature. 
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6) Contractor must submit their most recent audited profit and loss statement with positive
assets for consideration as evidence demonstrating financial capacity. The auditor’s letter shall 
be included. The County may request the full audit from the finalist. 

7) Contractor must submit any findings or fines related to state regulatory compliance in the
past four (4) years. The County reserves the right to disqualify contractors with compliance 
failures on the basis of past performance. 

8) The Contractor must, at all times during the term of the contract, carry professional liability
insurance covering occurrences on Guilford County premises with limits of not less than 
$3,000,000 dollars per occurrence or individual and not less than $6,000,000 aggregate, and 
that Guilford County must be named as an additional insured under said policy. The full 
insurance requirements are attached in the event terms and conditions. 

9) Contractor must agree to hold Guilford County harmless of any act committed by security
personnel unless those acts are committed as a result of direct instructions of authorized 
Guilford County personnel.  The successful contractor(s) must defend, indemnify, and hold 
harmless Guilford County and the offices and employees thereof, from and against any and all 
losses, liabilities, damages, injuries, claims, demands, costs and expenses of every kind and 
nature, whether or not covered by insurance, arising out of and in connection with any 
agreement the successful contractor may enter with Guilford County, unless specifically 
exempted therefore by the County and set out in the agreement with Guilford County. 

IV. Specific Requirements
1) A mandatory pre-proposal meeting conference will be held on Wednesday, March 20th at
2:00 pm in the Blue Room on Level 1 of the Old Guilford County Courthouse.  The address is 301 
West Market Street Greensboro, NC 27401.  Parking is available at the Greene Street Parking 
Deck.  Attendance is required for a contractor’s bid to be considered responsive. 

2) Registration/license requirements to perform security and/or company police duties are
solely the responsibility of the contractor. Copies of related documents shall be provided to 
Guilford County upon request to ensure requirements are being met. 

3) Personnel:   Guilford County, through its authorized representative, reserves the right to
approve or disapprove any persons from serving as security personnel. Guilford County further 
reserves the right to have removed from its property any security personnel deemed to be 
undesirable for any reason whatsoever.     

4) Interviews:  Prospective security personnel must be scheduled for an interview with Guilford
County Security staff prior to working on a Guilford County site. They must wear the 
appropriate prescribed uniform for the interview.  A written exam will be given by Guilford 
County to determine if they have the basic skills necessary to write an incident report and 
communicate with the public.  The time needed for this interview will be approximately thirty 
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(30) minutes, and will not be billable to Guilford County. The contractor will provide the 
following at the time of the interview: 

 Application
 Criminal records check for the past four (4) years
 Proof of urinalysis testing
 Private Protective Services Registration

5) For prospective supervisory/management personnel, the following additional documents are
required: 

 Resume’
 Documents supporting experience requirements
 Recommendation letter from the company
 Certificates of training relative to the position

6) For prospective Company/Special Police Officers, the following documents are required:

 Resume’
 Documents supporting experience requirements
 Recommendation letter from the company
 Certificates of training
 Certification document from the Department of Justice

7) Qualifications:   All security/company police personnel assigned to Guilford County property
must be able to read and write.  No security personnel shall be assigned who is not of good 
moral character or is under indictment or has been convicted of criminal violations except for 
minor traffic violations.  Driving under the influence or evading police are not considered minor 
traffic violations.  All personnel are expected to be helpful, courteous and effectively 
communicate with employees and the public.  Contractors are strongly urged to carefully 
screen prospective officers and select officers to work in areas that are best suited to their 
abilities.  Contractor will ensure all security personnel have been screened for amphetamines, 
barbiturates, benzodiazepines, cannabinoids, cocaine, opiates, methaqualone and 
phencyclidine before employment. No one will be permitted to work on County property 
without satisfactory test results.   

Security contractor must at their expense have a psychological evaluation conducted for all 
armed officers prior to their assignment on the Guilford County contracts.  Contractor agrees 
that armed/company police officers with unsatisfactory results will not be assigned to the 
Guilford County contract. 
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8) Management and Supervision: The contractor is required to handle scheduling, training and
compliance with the Private Protective Services Act and North Carolina Attorney General’s 
requirements.   

The Operations Manager and Site Supervisors must only conduct administrative business that 
pertains to this account. The hiring and initial training of officers as required by law must not be 
conducted on Guilford County property.  A supervisor must ensure all personnel are present for 
duty at the start of the shift, and promptly notify the Guilford County Shift Supervisor of any 
shortages. Courthouse personnel will be inspected at the start of the shift or soon as possible 
afterward. Inspections will address cleanliness and condition of the uniform and post 
equipment, as well as personal hygiene and fitness to perform duties. The Site Supervisor and 
Operations Manager in High Point and Greensboro are part of the daily staffing at the X-ray 
stations.  

9) Operations Manager Requirements: Three (3) years verifiable experience in law enforcement
or security, two (2) of which must be in a supervisory capacity, including hiring and counseling 
experience.  Will be trained and efficient in use of pepper spray and handcuffing procedures.  
Handcuffs and pepper spray will be provided by the contractor and will be worn while on duty.  
The operations manager will sign out each time he or she leaves the Greensboro Courthouse. 
With approval of Guilford County, the operations manager is permitted to be off-site for one 
hour per week for meetings or other administrative duties.  Guilford County will not be billed 
for this time.  The operations manager will make post visits of all sites at least once per month.  
Upper management is highly encouraged to make periodic site visits and record the 
time/date/location they were conducted. 

10) Site Supervisor Requirements:  One (1) year of verifiable experience in law enforcement or
security.  Will be trained and efficient in use of pepper spray and handcuffing procedures.  
Handcuffs and pepper spray will be provided by the contractor and will be worn while on duty. 

11) Uniform and Equipment Requirements:  Police/military type uniforms will be worn.
Uniforms will be clean, serviceable, and neatly pressed. A minimum of three pair of slacks and 
three shirts will be issued.   Black, highly shined military style footwear is required.  Shoes will 
have dark soles and no markings.  No athletic shoes.  Socks must be solid black or dark blue.  
Trousers will not have more than a single break in the bottom cuff area, nor will they be 
excessively tight.  Each officer will have one cold weather jacket and windbreaker.  A black, 
police style equipment belt designed to carry a portable radio and other gear will be worn.  
Sufficient rain gear and reflective vests will be available for those officers who work outdoors.  
A matching glove case and a pair of protective latex gloves will be carried. Officers working at X-
Ray stations will wear black, puncture/cut resistant gloves.  A security badge (metal or 
embroidered) and plastic/metal nametag will be worn over the pocket flap.  Officers must wear 
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the proper uniform at all times while on Guilford County property.  Company Police officers will 
carry a handgun, pepper spray, handcuffs, and puncture resistant gloves.  Conductive electric 
weapons are encouraged by not required.   

Contractor for Company Police services must have access to a vehicle should the need to 
transport someone in custody arise.  Local law enforcement agencies do not typically transport 
those arrested by Company Police. 

The contractor must present its proposed guidelines concerning grooming standards and wear 
of the uniform including hair color/styles, fingernails and jewelry prior to start of the contract.  
In addition, contractor will provide 8 X 10 head-to-toe photographs of a male security officer, a 
female security officer, a male Company Police officer and a female Company Police officer in 
their prescribed uniform.  Guilford County reserves the right to approve specifications based on 
safety and security considerations.   

In the event that a contractor’s employee does not meet grooming or dress code standards, the 
Security Director or his/her designee reserves the right to send the employee back to the 
contractor, who will allow the employee to correct any defects or send a replacement 
employee. The contractor shall not bill the County for their employee’s time to remedy the 
defect. 

12)  Schedules and Billing:  Unless otherwise directed, the holidays listed below are to be 
manned in the same manner as weekends.  The hourly billing rates to Guilford County will not 
increase during the terms of the contract, including renewal terms.  Guilford County will not 
pay premium holiday rates.  Schedule is subject to change. 
 

Martin Luther King Jr. Day    

Good Friday                 

Memorial Day                

Independence Day            

Labor Day                    

Veteran’s Day               

Thanksgiving Holidays (2 days)  

Christmas Holidays(3 days)   

New Year’s Day  

   

13) Possible Locations of Work:  At the pre-bid conference, Guilford County will provide a list of 
regularly scheduled hours and locations. These sites and hours are to be considered as probable 
and are subject to change without advance notice.   

14)  Estimated Hours of Work 

There are no guarantees of minimum or maximum hours per week.  Guilford County may 
require extra security officers for special events.  A two-hour minimum will be paid by Guilford 
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County if the officer shows at the scheduled time and place.  Guilford County will NOT pay 
overtime rates except when the Director of Security or his/her designee request additional 
service with less than a 24-hour notice, which would reasonably cause the contractor to have to 
pay an overtime rate to employees.  The overtime billing rate must not exceed 1.5 times the 
normal billing rate.  Guilford County will not pay for services that have not been performed as 
prescribed.   

The regular officer/unarmed rate is the standard rate all officers provided unless the County 
has requested officers who are armed officers or are company police, in which case those 
billing rates will be paid. Supervisor and Operations Manager billing charges shall be 
incorporated into the regular officer rate as well as all overhead costs of the contractor.  

Guilford County will pay the regular/unarmed officer rate for regular services. In the event that 
the security company sends a higher level officer, the County will only pay the billing rate of the 
requested officer.  

The contractor will pay liquidated damages of $16.00 per hour (prorated) for every hour of 
service that is not filled.  Liquidated damages must be deducted from the billing for the period 
that the shortage occurred.   

15) Training Requirements:  The contractor’s training program will be evaluated by Guilford
County with consideration given to designated training site, training materials and 
quality/amount of training provided.  The contractor shall be required, at their cost, to begin 
overlap training with the current contractor no later than June 21, 2019 unless otherwise 
approved by Guilford County.  All security personnel will be trained on site for 24 hours by a 
qualified trainer prior to working alone on post, except for the High Point booth attendant and 
x-ray operators which require 40 hours of training. The contractor will only assign training 
duties to those who have adequate knowledge and a minimum of six months of experience in 
the position(s) for which they are conducting the training. A maximum of ten (10) trainers will 
be permitted.  The contractor will provide a list of their qualified trainers for Guilford County 
approval.  Only the Director or his/her designee may make exceptions to the training 
requirements.  The contractor is responsible for site training costs.  Training must include post 
orientation, safety, proper wear of the uniform, customer service, use of hand held radios, and 
report writing.  Prospective officers may be required to demonstrate their proficiency prior to 
working in a position.  In addition to supervisory personnel, armed officers and company police, 
Guilford County will require up to eight (8) regular security officers to carry handcuffs and 
pepper spray.  The training and equipping of such officers will be at the contractor’s expense.  
Guilford County employs and maintains two (2) Segway personal transportation devices.  
Contractor will ensure adequate personnel are trained to use these devices on patrol.  Safety 
helmets will be provided by the County. The total load limit is established at 250 pounds 
including gear.  Officers may be tasked with assisting people who are wheelchair bound.  

ATTACHMENT A
DocuSign Envelope ID: 7BA3D503-9914-41F4-86D7-A707A9A8A1D9



8 

Personnel who perform this function must first receive training for safety reasons. 

16) Training Records:  Each officer assigned to Guilford County property will have a formal
training record on file in the Operation Manager’s office. Training records must be made 
available to Guilford County security supervisors at any reasonable time for inspection.  Such 
records must show the specific site/duties officers are certified in.  The contractor will maintain 
a status board in the Operation Manager’s office in the courthouse. The board will display the 
photos, names, hire date, and positions each officer is certified to work.  

17) Employee Recruitment and Retention Commitment:

Guilford County highly values the quality and conduct of security employees.  The contractor is 
required to complete and submit the Recruitment and Retention Plan Commitment Form, 
Attachment A, found under the Attachments Tab of the event.  The measures committed to by 
the security contractor in this form will be honored for the duration of the contract.  
Contractors will be scored in part based on payment and benefit measures they use to recruit 
and retain quality employees. 

18) Other Requirements:   Security personnel may be called upon to evacuate buildings in the
event of a fire or certain other emergencies.  Since effecting an evacuation requires ascending 
stairwells, security officers will need to be able to climb the entire length of stairs in the 
facilities they work in.   The County may require prospective officers to demonstrate their 
ability to do so before allowing them to work on a Guilford County site.   

V.          Responsibilities of Contractor 
 Contractor must comply with all federal, state and local laws governing private security 
agencies and will not subcontract any services.   

The billing period is monthly, from the first through last day of the month.  Invoice and required 
back up documentation must be received by the County Security Office no later than the 15th 
day of the month following the billing period. Contractor must include with each billing: 
accurate and complete time records.  At its option, Guilford County may request time records 
on a more frequent basis. Billing must not be manually calculated. Software of the contractor’s 
choice shall be used.  Following the Security Department’s review of the monthly submittal, it is 
the contractor’s responsibility to correct any billing errors and submit the corrections promptly 
to the Security Department. A complete and accurate invoice is required for payment 
authorization.   

Contractor will be held accountable for all County issued equipment and will replace any and all 
equipment damaged, destroyed, or lost except for damage due to normal wear and tear.  The 
contractor will replace any funds or money that is lost, misplaced, or unaccounted for which 
their employees are entrusted. 
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The Security Services Contractor is responsible for equipping the County provided office with 
high speed internet, a personal computer, fax machine, printer, and smart phone for site 
related business. 

VI. Responsibilities of Guilford County

Guilford County will provide office space and basic furniture for the Operations Manager at no 
cost.   

The Guilford County Security Director or representative must approve all operational policies 
and procedures implemented at any County building.  Guilford County provides all surveillance, 
metal detection equipment, two-way radio equipment and guard tour verification equipment.  
Guilford County employs 17 security personnel who supervise the contracted staff and conduct 
other security functions for the county.  Guilford County provides standard operating 
procedures for most posts.  

Guilford County will only be responsible for and will only pay for services already rendered.  
Guilford County will not be responsible or liable for future or projected services.  Guilford 
County will not be held responsible or liable for future or projected revenue losses due to the 
reduction of service hours or the cancellation of the service contract. 

VII. Submittal Requirements
1) Proposal Format:

No other documentation or information other than what is listed below shall be submitted by a 
contractor unless it is at the request of Guilford County. 

Contractor must upload the following proposal documents in the online event: 

 A letter of introduction from Contractor’s company on company letterhead with the
company’s legal name

 A summary of the Contractor’s experience and qualifications.
 Contractor must complete a series of questions in the event to submit their proposal

electronically. Questions may require yes/no or text answers. For some questions, a file
may be required to be uploaded to complete the question response.

 Contractor must complete and upload Attachment A
 Contractor must submit estimated weekly pricing and actual billing prices for each type

of billable officer (unarmed, armed and company police).

Weekly billing rates are submitted for each officer type to factor in the estimated number of 
weekly hours for each officer type with the hourly charge that will be billed to the County.  The 
unarmed Security Services Contract utilizes a considerably larger number of hours than armed 
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and company police.  See the evaluation matrix sections in Section IX. for complete 
information. 

Hourly billing rates are the rates that will be billed to the County based on actual time worked 
in each of the three billable officer types. 

2) Security Services Contract Event Lines

The estimated weekly costs and the actual hourly billing rates for Site Supervisors and 
Operations Manager are allocated along with all overhead costs to both estimated weekly and 
hourly rate billed to County for Unarmed Officer services. 

 Unarmed Officer Estimated Weekly Billing Rate (includes all allocated salaries and
overhead costs)

 Unarmed Officer Hourly Billing Rate for actual hours to be invoiced (includes allocated
salaries and overhead costs)

 Armed Officer Estimated Weekly Billing Rate (includes overhead costs)
 Armed Officer Hourly Billing Rate (for actual hours to be invoiced (includes overhead

costs)

3) Company Police Services Contract Event Lines

 Company Police Estimated Weekly Billing Rate (includes all overhead costs)
 Company Police Hourly Billing Rate for actual hours to be invoiced (includes overhead

costs)

4) Contractor(s) will attach the following items with their proposals:

 Letter of Introduction
 Proposal
 Attachments to fill out and upload

o Attachment A: Recruitment and Retention Plan Commitment

5) Other Attachments for Information

 Attachment B Schedule of Estimated Contract Hours and Locations for 2019/2020
provides locations and general service hours by service type (Unarmed, Armed and
Company Police)

6) Event Questions

 Required questions must be answered to submit your RFP response.

ATTACHMENT A
DocuSign Envelope ID: 7BA3D503-9914-41F4-86D7-A707A9A8A1D9
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VIII. Anticipated Event Schedule

Event Opens 3/8/2019  
Q&A Opens 3/8/2019 
Mandatory Pre-Proposal 
Meeting Conference 

3/20/2019 at 2:00 pm in the Blue Room of 
the Old Guilford County Courthouse at 301 
W. Market Street, Greensboro, NC. Parking 
is available in the Greene Street Parking 
Deck. 

Q&A Closes 3/21/2019 at 3:00 PM 
Addendum Issued if Any 3/27/18 
Event Closes 4/8/2019 

IX. Award Criteria

The contract(s) will be awarded to one or more contractors based on their meeting minimum 
requirements and the best value standard of award, taking into consideration pricing, 
qualifications, capacity and Employee Recruitment and Retention Plan Commitments.   

X. Evaluation Process 

A committee of County staff will separately score and rank proposals for 

1) Security Services

2) Company Police based on using the following matrices found below:

(This section left intentionally blank.) 

ATTACHMENT A
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REGULAR SECURITY SERVICES EVALUATION MATRIX (Armed and Unarmed Officers) 

Criteria Description 

Total 
Maximum 
Category 

Points 

Total 
Maximum 
Points All 

Categories
Estimated weekly billing rates will be evaluated for a maximum total of 70 
points. 

70 

Hourly Billing 
Rates 

Billing rate for Regular/Unarmed officers 
(includes costs for Supervisors, Operations 
Manager and all other overhead costs of the 
contractor) 

60 

Billing rates for armed officers (includes all 
other overhead costs of the contractor) 

10 

TOTAL 

Contractors qualifications will be evaluated for a maximum of 10 points. 

10 

Qualifications 

Demonstrated responsibility and capability in 
the performance of work that is similar in size 
and scope. 

4 

Strength of references 2 
Compliance with state requirements. 2 
Training that exceeds state requirements  2 

TOTAL 

The Recruitment and Retention Plan Commitments will be evaluated for a 
maximum of 20 points. 

20 

Recruitment 
and 

Retention 
Plan 

Commitments 
of the 

Contractor 

Wages contractor will pay to Armed Officer 
and annual increase percentage over three 
years 

3 

Wages contractor will pay to 
Regular/Unarmed Officer and annual increase 
percentage over three years 

6 

Wages contractor will pay to Supervisor 3 
Wages contractor will pay to Operations 
Manager 3 

# of paid time off days (sick and vacation) 3 
Provision of all uniform items (see RFP for 
items) 2 

TOTAL 

GRAND TOTAL 100 

ATTACHMENT A
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2. COMPANY POLICE SERVICES EVALUATION MATRIX

Criteria Description 

Total 
Maximum 
Category 

Points 

Total 
Maximum 
Points All 

Categories
Estimated weekly billing rates will be evaluated for a maximum total of 80 
points. 

80 

Estimated 
Weekly 

Billing Rates 

 Estimated Weekly Billing rate for Company 
Police officers (Includes all overhead costs of 
the contractor) 

80 

TOTAL 

Contractors qualifications will be evaluated for a maximum of 10 points. 

10 

Qualifications 

Demonstrated responsibility and capability in 
the performance of work that is similar in size 
and scope. 

4 

Strength of references 2 
Compliance with state requirements. 2 
Training that exceeds state requirements  2 

TOTAL 

The Recruitment and Retention Plan Commitments will be evaluated for a 
maximum of 20 points. 

10 

Employee 
Recruitment 

and 
Retention 

Plan 
Commitments 

of the 
Contractor 

Wages contractor will pay to Company Police 
and annual increase percentage over three 
years 

4 

# of paid time off days (sick and vacation) 
3 

Provision of all uniform items (see RFP for 
items) 3 

TOTAL 

GRAND TOTAL 100 

ATTACHMENT A
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XI. Anticipated Schedule of Award (subject to change)

Evaluation of Proposals 4/18/2019 
Board of Commissioners 
considers recommendations 
for their authorization 

5/23/19 

Execution of Contracts 6/30/19 
Contract Start Date 7/1/2019 

XII. Bid Submittal Instructions and Requirements for Electronic Events

1) All suppliers, who plan to submit a bid must register as a supplier in the Guilford County
eProcurement System. Through the Supplier Portal, suppliers may browse to the open event
or search for an event by name or number. Instructions to register as a supplier, update
registration and bid on events are available in the Contractors Tool Box at the link below:

https://www.guilfordcountync.gov/our-county/purchasing/contractors-tool-box 

2) Suppliers sign in to begin submitting their response to an event.  Click on the event to open it,
then click on respond now and follow the instructions for each tab.
All bids must be submitted electronically via the following website:
www.guilfordcountync.gov/sourcing by the event date and close time. There will be no
exceptions.  

3) All questions related to this event must be submitted online using the Question & Answer
(Q&A) Forum in accordance with the event schedule.  Each question asked will be answered
online for any/all contractors to view.  No questions will be considered after the Q&A close
date and time. No exceptions.

4) All official County responses to prospective Bidder/Supplier’s questions and official addenda
regarding bid document revisions or additional information will be communicated by the
County through the online Q/A function tab within this event.

5) To complete the lines portion of a submittal in the Strategic Sourcing Event, open the lines
tab to enter pricing for each line.

6) Use the provided line description, unit of measure and quantity to complete the entries for
each line.

7) Upload all additional documentation required in the bid document as an attachment or
attachments.

ATTACHMENT A
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8) Answer all questions required for submittal. Attachments may be required.

9) All bids must be complete and submitted through the electronic event before the event date
and close time. The system cannot accept late submittals.

10) Suppliers are responsible for checking the event for any addendums prior to completion
and submission of their response. Addendum requirements, if any, must be included in the
submittal.

11) To complete an electronic submittal, be sure to click the “Submit” button.  Clicking the
“Done” button puts the response into a draft state that can be completed at a later time, but
will not be part of the submitted responses until submitted via the “Submit” button.

12) Suppliers are strongly encouraged to submit their bids, qualifications or proposals with all
required documentation at least 24 hours in advance. Guilford County will not be responsible
for any technical difficulties that may occur and result in the inability to submit.

13) For technical assistance to register as a supplier or submit a response in the Guilford County
Electronic Procurement System, please contact the buyer listed on this event. For
immediate assistance, please contact the Purchasing Department at 336-641-3314 and ask
to speak to an available Buyer.

14) For questions related to the Minority and Women Business Enterprise Program contact
Cynthia Barnes-Phipps at 336-641-4565 or cbarnes1@guilfordcountync.gov.

15) ALL QUESTIONS related to the specifications must be submitted electronically by means of
the Q & A feature included within this bidding event. NO QUESTIONS will be answered by
telephone, email, written correspondence or other means except as described herein.
Answers to electronic questions properly submitted will be sent out electronically by means
of the above described Q & A feature to all properly registered suppliers who received the
Initial Notification of bidding event. Those suppliers who registered after the Event open
date and time will not receive electronic correspondence relative to this Event. There shall
be no communication with any Guilford County employees other than by means of the Q &
A feature. Violation of this requirement may invalidate your proposal.

XIII. Other Event Terms and Conditions

The following attachments with instructions and requirements are provided in the Event Terms 
and Conditions Tab. Contractor’s submittal through the electronic event indicates full 
agreement with all terms and conditions in the event.  Requests for any changes to these terms 
and conditions shall be submitted through the event Question and Answer Forum. 

ATTACHMENT A
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 Purchasing Terms and Conditions
 Sample Contract Terms (Price Only)
 Insurance Requirements for Security Services

END RFP 

ATTACHMENT A
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Position
Starting Year 

Hourly Wage

Second Year 

Hourly Wage

Third Year 

Hourly Wage

Starting Year 

Paid Vacation 

Days

Second Year 

Paid Vacation 

Days

Third Year 

Paid Vacation 

Days

Starting Year 

Paid Sick Days

Second Year 

Paid Sick Days

Third Year 

Paid Sick Days

Operations Manager

Site Supervisor

Regular/Unarmed Officer

Armed officer

Company Police Officer

Uniform and Shoes 

provided at no cost to all 

officers. (Yes or No).

Recruitment and Retention Plan Commitment

Schedule of Wages and Benefits

Contractors are required to submit their commitments to wages and benefits for their security company's employees. Please answer questions completely and upload 

this attachment to the event. This will be part of the performance expectation under the contract.

Event #646 Security Services Attachment A

ATTACHMENT A
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Projected Duty 

Hours

Approx Weekly 

Hours

Projected Duty 

Hours

Approx Weekly 

Hours

Projected Duty 

Hours

Approx Weekly 

Hours

0800-1700 40 0900-1400 25 0800-1700 45
0730-1630 40 0800-1700 40 0800-1700 45
0700-1500 40 0800-1800 50 0800-1700 45
0730-1400 33 0800-1700 40 0800-1700 45
0800-1600 40 Sub Total 155 0800-1700 45
0730-1030 15 Holiday hours -8 0800-1700 45
0800-1700 40 TOTAL 147 Sub Total 270

Varies 4 Holiday hours -12
0800-1000 1 TOTAL 258

Varies 2
1700-2000 7
1730-2000 5

Varies 5
0730-1430 35
1430-2100 33
0630-1030 20
1700-2100 20

Varies 2 Greensboro Courthouse 
0700-1900 60 Independence Building
0800-1700 40 Maple St. Building
0730-1200 27 Greene St. Building
1600-2300 35 BB&T Building
2300-0700 40 Old Courthouse
0600-0600 50 Public Health
0700-1500 40 High Point Courthouse
0800-1600 40 High Point Public Health
0800-1500 35 Russell St. Building

Varies 3
0700-2000 65
0800-1400 30
0700-1900 60

Sub Total 906
Holiday hours -37
TOTAL 869

301 W. Market St., Greensboro
1100 E. Wendover Ave., Greensboro

Regular/Unarmed (Includes Ops 

Manager and two Supervisors)
Armed Company Police

Current Locations  of Work 

Holiday hours are a weekly average based on 12 County holidays per year.  Except for a post in 

HP, there is usually no need for contracted personnel on weekends or holidays.  This can 

change based on the needs of the County.  Any Judge's conference if held, may also reduce 

courthouse manning.

201 S. Eugene St., Greensboro
400 W. Market St., Greensboro
1203 Maple St., Greensboro
201 S. Greene St., Greensboro
201 W. Market St., Greensboro

Attachment B Estimated Contract Hours and Locations for FY 2019/2020

505 E. Green Dr., High Point
501 E. Green Dr., High Point
325 E. Russell St., High Point

ATTACHMENT A
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Response For Supplier: Weiser Security Services, Inc
Event # : 646-4

Name: Guilford County Security Services

Reference: Professional Services

Description: On behalf of the Guilford County Security Department, the Guilford County Purchasing Department is
soliciting Proposals for contracted security services.   The two services required include Regular Police
Officers (armed and unarmed) and Company Police Officers. The contract(s) will be awarded to one or
two qualified service provider(s) for armed and unarmed security officers and/or Company Police
Officers.

Preview Date: Q & A Open Date: 03/08/2019 05:01:00 PM

Open Date: 03/08/2019 05:00:00 PM Q & A Close Date: 03/25/2019 03:00:00 PM

Close Date: 04/08/2019 03:00:00 PM Dispute Close Date:

Responded To: 6 Out of 6 Lines

Total Bid Amount: 16,803.83      USD

Question Responses

Question Answer Attachment

Do you agree to put in place the insurance
requirements described in the RFP upon
notice of intent to award?

Yes

If selected as a finalist are you willing to
provide a recent audit that includes a
balance sheet?

Yes Will Provide.doc

Have you attached the recruitment and
retention plan Schedule of Wages and
Benefits that you commit to provide for
the duration of the contract?

Yes Recruitment and Retention Attachment A
(1) xlsx.do

Have you had any warnings or fines
imposed by the NC Private Protective
Services Board since March 1, 2015?  If
you answered yes, upload an attachment
providing detailed information.

Yes Protective Services.pdf

April 8, 2019 Page 1

3:41:35 PM
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Question Answer Attachment

Has your company had any warnings or
fines imposed by the NC Department of
Labor since March 1, 2015?   If you
answered yes, upload an attachment
providing detailed information.

No No Fines.doc

Have you uploaded your grooming policy? Yes Grooming Policy.docx

Have you uploaded your uniform photos? Yes Uniform PHOTO.png

What is your transition plan for contract
start up and close out here

See Transition Plan in Attached

Are any local, state, or federal tax liens
recorded against your business?    If so
describe here. Attach additional pages if
needed.

No- No Fines.doc

What specialized training such as CPR,
terrorism/gang awareness, etc. do you
provide for officers in addition to state
requirements.

See attached Training for Guilford in
attachments

Training Topics (1).docx

Who are your three references for
contracted work of similar size and scope?
Describe project(s) with each reference in
past three years and include current
contact information for each reference.
Upload attachment if additional space is
needed.

See attached:  Also, We just transitioned
Raleigh Housing Authority

Guilford References.docx

How many weekly service hours do you
provide at your largest current account
and how many months and years have you
had this?

Halliburton Co. 14,000 hpw 20190405143416316.pdf

Do you have the legal and binding
authority to enter into a contract with
Guilford County on behalf of your
corporation or organization?

Yes

Upon request are you willing to return all
signed and notarized documents and
affadavits attached to this bidding event?

Yes

Have you completed and uploaded the
attached E-Verify Affidavit?

Yes Affidavit.pdf

Have you uploaded your Equal
Opportunity, which is for informational
purposes only (See page 2, Section 4).

Yes AAP 2019.doc

Do you understand that any proposed
changes to the terms and conditions of the
event must be submitted through the
Question and Answer Forum?

Yes

Response Attachments

Event # 646-4: Guilford County Security Services
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Attachment

Woman PHOTO.jpg

Uniform PHOTO.png

Transition Plan (1).docx

Branch Org Chart.docx

Training Topics (1).docx

Span of Control (1).docx

Welcome Letter Example Guilford.doc

Guilford Cover 1.pdf

Guilford County Proposal .pdf

Line Responses

Line 1: Est Cost per Week for Unarmed Security Officers
Description: Calculate the estimated weekly cost for unarmed officers by multiplying 869 estimated hours for one week

by your hourly unarmed officer billing rate, AND add your estimated weekly Supervisors, Operations Manager
and weekly overhead expenses to calculate the total estimated weekly unarmed officers cost. Note that this
estimated cost line will be used with the armed officer estimated weekly cost line to award the Security
Services Contract. Hours are subject to change.

Item: ESTIMATED WEEKLY COST      SECURITY SERVICES CONTRACT      Est Unarmed Officers cost/week

Commodity Code: 990      SECURITY, FIRE, SAFETY, AND EMERGENCY SERVICES

Quantity: 1.00 UOM: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 13,855.59000 Extended Price: 13,855.59

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Vendor Item: UNARMED GUARD      Unarmed Guard Weekly

Comments: Weekly Unarmed Cost

Line 2: Est Cost per Week for Armed Security Officers
Description: Calculate the estimated weekly cost for armed officers by multiplying 147 estimated hours for one week by

your hourly armed officer billing rate,

Note that this estimated cost line will be used with the unarmed officer estimated weekly cost line to award
the Security Services Contract. Hours are subject to change.

Event # 646-4: Guilford County Security Services
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Item: ESTIMATED WEEKLY COST      SECURITY SERVICES CONTRACT      Armed OfficEr Est Cost/Wk

Commodity Code: 990      SECURITY, FIRE, SAFETY, AND EMERGENCY SERVICES

Quantity: 1.00 UOM: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 2,912.49000 Extended Price: 2,912.49

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Vendor Item: ARMED GUARD      Armed Guard Weekly

Comments: Armed Guard weekly

Line 3: Est Cost Per Week for Company Police
Description: Calculate the estimated weekly cost for company police by multiplying  258 estimated hours for one week by

your hourly company police billing rate AND add your estimated weeklyoverhead expenses to calculate the
total estimated weekly company police cost for the Company Police Contract.

Note that this calculated estimated cost line will be used with the calculated company police estimated
weekly cost line to award the Company Police Services Contract. Hours are subject to change.

Item: ESTIMATED WEEKLY COST      COMPANY POLICE SERVCS CONTRACT      Company Police Est Cost/Wk

Commodity Code: 990      SECURITY, FIRE, SAFETY, AND EMERGENCY SERVICES

Quantity: 1.00 UOM: EA

Bid Quantity: 1.0000

No Charge: No No Bid: Yes

Vendor Item: COMPANY POLICE      Company Police

Line 4: Hourly Billing Rate for Unarmed Officers
Description: THe Hourly Billing rate is the actual rate that will be used to bill the County

Note that the hourly billing rate for Unarmed Officers shall incoporate an allocation for the Site Supervisors
and Operations Manager costs AND all associated overhead costs for the Security Services Contract.

Item: UNARMED OFFICERS BILLING RATE      SECURITY CONTRACT      Unarmed Officr Billing Rate/Hr

Commodity Code: 990      SECURITY, FIRE, SAFETY, AND EMERGENCY SERVICES

Quantity: 1.00 UOM: HR

Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 15.94000 Extended Price: 15.94

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Vendor Item: UNARMED COMPOSITE RATE      Unarmed Composite Rate

Event # 646-4: Guilford County Security Services
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Comments: Unarmed Composite Bill Rate

Line 5: Hourly Billing Rate for Armed Officers
Description: THe Hourly Billing rate is the actual rate that will be used to bill the County

Note that the hourly billing rate for Unarmed Officers shall incoporate an allocation for all associated
overhead costs for the Security Services Contract.

Item: ARMED OFFICERS BILLING RATE      SECURITY CONTRACT      Armed Officer Billing Rate/Hr

Commodity Code: 990      SECURITY, FIRE, SAFETY, AND EMERGENCY SERVICES

Quantity: 1.00 UOM: HR

Bid Quantity: 1.0000 Unit Price: 19.81000 Extended Price: 19.81

No Charge: No No Bid: No

Vendor Item: ARMED GUARD COMPOSITE      Armed Guard Composite

Comments: Armed Guard Composite Rate

Line 6: Hourly Billing Rate for Company Police
Description: The Hourly Biling Rate is the actual rate that will be used ot bill the County.

Note that the hourly billing rate for Company Police shall incorporate an allocation for all associated
overhead costs.

Item: COMPANY POLICE BILLING RATE      COMPANY POLICE CONTRACT      Company Police Billing Rate/Hr

Commodity Code: 990      SECURITY, FIRE, SAFETY, AND EMERGENCY SERVICES

Quantity: 1.00 UOM: HR

Bid Quantity: 1.0000

No Charge: No No Bid: Yes

Vendor Item: COMPANY POLICE      Company Police

Event # 646-4: Guilford County Security Services
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ATTACHMENT C

 FINANCIAL EXPOSURE FOR 1 YEAR SECURITY SERVICES Wesier Security

UNARMED HOURLY RATE 15.94$                                                    

ARMED HOURLY RATE 19.81$                                                    

TOTAL UNARMED WEEKLY HOURS NEEDED FOR SITE(S) COVERAGE 967.25

TOTAL ARMED WEEKLY HOURS NEEDED FOR SITE(S) COVERAGE 157.5

WEEKLY TOTAL HOURS PAID UNARMED 15,417.97$                                            

WEEKLY TOTAL HOURS PAID ARMED 3,120.08$                                              

PAID WEEKLY TOTAL UNARMED AND ARMED 18,538.04$                                            

$18,538.04

4.33 weeks per month

PAID MONTHLY TOTAL UNARMED AND ARMED 80,269.71$                                            

18,538.04$                                            

x 52 weeks

PAID YEARLY TOTAL UNARMED AND ARMED 963,978.08$                                         

MINUS HOLIDAYS UNARMED 12 holidays X $15.94 X 160.25 hrs

MINUS HOLIDAYS ARMED 12 holidays x 19.81 x 31.5

30,652.62$                                            

7,488.18$                                              

TOTAL HOLIDAYS DEDUCTION 38,140.80$                                            

963,978.08$                                         

38,140.80$                                            

WEISER SECURITY GRAND TOTAL FINANCIAL EXPOSURE YEARLY TOTAL UNARMED AND ARMED 925,837.28$                                         




